
ABOUT US

PARMINDER MAKKAR
CORPORATION
Parminder Makkar Notary Corporation
offers the knowledge and skills to
ensure that you receive the proper
paperwork prepared in the right
manner. They offer comprehensive
documentation and notary services to
customers in Surrey and the Lower
Mainland. Oaths and affirmations must
be administered by notaries public. As
well as taking affidavits and statutory
declarations, creating powers of
attorney, and certifying authentic
copies of papers, they can serve as
witnesses in a variety of legal
proceedings.

We at Parminder Makkar Notary
Corporation are dedicated to
protecting your rights and looking out
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for your best interests. Along with
helping you buy and sell real estate
and property, we also provide services
to aid with the mortgage process.

Contact Parminder Makkar Notary
Corporation for all of your notarial and
document needs.

https://notaryinsurrey.ca/sale-and-purchase-of-real-estate/
https://notaryinsurrey.ca/wills-and-estate-planning/
https://notaryinsurrey.ca/representative-agreements/


https://notaryinsurrey.ca/notarization-and-authentication/
https://notaryinsurrey.ca/letter-of-invitation-sponsorship/
https://notaryinsurrey.ca/leases-contracts-business-sales/
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=aCKYt_wPgbo
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Office Hours

Monday – Friday

9:30AM – 5:00PM

Saturday

11:00AM - 3:00PM

Our Address

Unit 102-8028 128 Street, Surrey
BC V3W 4E9

makkarnotary@gmail.com

604-593-4455

604-593-4456

A Proud Member Of

Very professional and knowledgeable experience working with them. They explain
each and everything steps by step and help to save your $$. Highly recommended.

Neeraj kathuria
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https://notaryinsurrey.ca/contact-us/
https://notaryinsurrey.ca/contact-us/
https://notaryinsurrey.ca/contact-us/
https://notaryinsurrey.ca/contact-us/
https://www.facebook.com/pmnotarysurreybc
https://www.instagram.com/pmnotarysurreybc/
https://www.google.com/maps/place/8028+128+St+%23206,+Surrey,+BC+V3W+4E9,+Canada/@49.1486419,-122.8695531,17z/data=!3m1!4b1!4m9!1m2!2m1!1s8028+128+St+%23206,+Surrey,+BC+V3W+4E9,+Canada!3m5!1s0x5485d982b615f215:0x7de499994b759659!8m2!3d49.1486384!4d-122.8669782!15sCiw4MDI4IDEyOCBTdCAjMjA2LCBTdXJyZXksIEJDIFYzVyA0RTksIENhbmFkYZIBEGNvbXBvdW5kX3NlY3Rpb27gAQA
mailto:makkarnotary@gmail.com
tel:604-593-4455
tel:604-593-4456
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